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Environmental declaration

One of our corporate goals is to structure all corporate activities so that they protect the environment in the best 
possible way.

LKW WALTER’s environmental policy is a fundamental part of our 2024 vision and characterises our corporate  
strategy, which is based on the pillars of sustainability. Responsibility for implementation does not solely lie with 
management – every employee is asked to make a personal contribution. 

LKW WALTER supports the goals of the European Commission in terms of the “Green Deal”. In the long-term  
perspective, we have therefore set ourselves the goal of making the future of LKW WALTER climate-neutral by 2050. 
As part of our corporate spirit, we have not only given the topic of the environment a name with "Green for Future",  
but are also successively implementing new projects in the spirit of sustainability.

As a pioneer and one of the biggest players in combined transport in Europe, LKW WALTER has been making an 
essential contribution to reducing pollution in transport for decades. We’re consistently pursuing this. On the one hand, 
by expanding sustainable, low-emission transport solutions, on the other hand by using technical progress in the  
development of alternative drivetrains (electromobility, hydrogen) and energy sources (Bio-LNG, HVO).

We include our suppliers and transport partners in our ambitious goals. For this purpose, appropriate tools have been 
developed to communicate our environmental requirements in a way that everyone can understand and to check their 
implementation. In joint projects, we develop logistics solutions to reduce or avoid pollutant emissions.

LKW WALTER uses digitalisation to control and optimise work processes. The development of automated planning  
software and the cooperation with business partners to implement optimisation concepts help us to keep  
empty mileage and consequently pollutant emissions as low as possible. Because each investment is based on our 
environmental philosophy, we are steadily increasing the level of efficiency in the use of resources such as energy, 
water, and raw materials. 

By expanding and using renewable energy, such as geothermal energy and photovoltaics, LKW WALTER is gradually 
developing the two sites at Wiener Neudorf and Kufstein into energy self-sufficient, emission-free operating sites.

We also take all reasonable and effective measures to continually reduce waste. 

Our self-imposed restrictions on the transport of dangerous goods (only selected classes of hazardous materials) 
reduce the risk of environmentally dangerous road and rail accidents.

When it comes to environmental issues, we place great emphasis on the opinion of our employees and implement 
their constructive suggestions and initiatives wherever possible. Environmental protection is also a central topic in our 
internal education and training programmes.

We report comprehensively and regularly on the activities and sustainability status of the company, both internally and 
externally. We also conduct an ongoing and open dialogue with all social groups, with our employees, customers, 
suppliers, the neighbouring communities and the authorities.
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